
(1) 

 

 
  

 

 

ೇಷ ಾಜ  ಪ ೆ 
 

 

 

PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT 
 

NOTIFICATION 
 

NO.DPAL 09 SHASHANA 2020, BENGALURU, DATED: 19.10.2020 
 

Ordered that the translation of the Karnataka Race Courses Licensing 

(Amendment) Act, 2020 (Karnataka Act 23 of 2020) in Kannada language, be 

published as authorised by the Governor of the Karnataka under section 5-A of 

the Karnataka official language Act, 1963 in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-

ordinary   for general Information.   

 

The following translation of the Karnataka Race Courses Licensing 

(Amendment) Act, 2020 (Karnataka Act 23 of 2020) in Kannada language, is 

published in the Official Gazette under the authority of the Governor of Karnataka 

under section 5-A of the Karnataka official language Act 1963. 

 

KARNATAKA  ACT  NO.23 OF 2020 
(First published in the Karnataka  Gazette Extra-ordinary on the 19th  Day of 

October 2020) 
 

THE KARNATAKA RACE COURSES LICENSING (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2020 

(Received the assent of the Governor on the 19th day of October 2020) 
 

 

 A Act further to amend the Karnataka Race Courses Licensing Act, 1952. 

     ¨sÁUÀ – 4 J 
      Part – lV A 

, 19 , 2020 ( , 27, ಶಕವಷ  ೧೯೪2) 

BENGALURU, MONDAY, 19, OCTOBER, 2020 ( ASHWAYUJA, 27,  SHAKAVARSHA, 1942) 
. 478 

No. 478 



2 

 
  Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Race Courses       

Licensing Act, 1952 (Karnataka Act VIII of 1952) for the purposes hereinafter 

appearing; 

 Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy first year of 

the Republic of India as follows:- 
 

 1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the    

Karnataka Race Courses Licensing (Amendment) Act, 2020. 

(2) It shall come into force at once.     

 2. Amendment of sections 4.- In the Karnataka Race Courses Licensing 

Act, 1952 (Karnataka Act VIII of 1952) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act), 

in section 4, after the word  “Government”, wherever it occurs, the words “or the 

officer authorised by the Government” shall be inserted. 

 3. Amendment of section 5.-  In section of 5 of the Principal Act, for the 

words “five hundred rupees”, the words “fifty thousand rupees” shall be 

substituted. 

 4. Amendment of section 6.- In section 6 of the Principal Act, for the words 

“one thousand rupees”, the words “one lakh rupees” shall be substituted. 

 5.  Amendment of section 7.- In section 7 of the Principal Act,- 

          (i) in sub-section (1),-  

(a) after the word “Government”, the words “or the  officer  

authorised  by the Government” shall be inserted; and 

 (b) for the words “one thousand  rupees”, the words “one  lakh 

rupees” shall be  substituted; 
 

         (ii)  in sub-section (2),-  

(a) after the word “Government”, the words “or the  officer  

authorised  by the Government” shall be inserted; and 

(b) for the word “one thousand  rupees”, the words “one  lakh 

rupees” shall be  substituted. 
 

 6. Amendment of section 8 – In section 8 of the Principal Act, after the 

word “Government”, the words “or the officer authorised by the Government” shall 

be inserted. 

  



 3 

 
 7. Amendment of section 9 – In section 9 of the Principal Act in sub-section 

(1) after the word “Government”, the words “or the officer authorised by the 

Government” shall be inserted 
 

By Order and in the name of  
 the Governor of Karnataka, 

 
(K. DWARAKANATA BABU) 

Secretary to Government 
Department of Parliamentary Affairs  

and Legislation 
 

ಸ ೕಯ ವ ವ ರಗ  ಮ  ಸನ ರಚ  ಸ ಲಯ 
ಅ ಚ  

: ವ ಇ 09 ಸನ 2020, ಂಗ , ಂಕ:19.10.2020 
 

ಕ ಟಕ  ೕ ಗ  ಪರ ನ  ೕ ವ ಅ ಯಮ, 1952  (1952ರ 

ಕ ಟಕ ಅ ಯಮ VIII) ಮತ  ಪ  ಡ  ಒಂ  ಅ ಯಮ ಇದ  2020 

ರ ಅ ೕಬ   ಂಗಳ 19  ಂಕ  ಜ ಲರ ಒ  , ನ  

ವ  ಇದ  2020 ರ ಕ ಟಕ ಅ ಯಮ : 23 ಎಂ  ಕ ಟಕ 

ಜ  ಪತ ದ  ಪ ಕ ಸ ಂ  ಆ ಸ . 
 

2020 ರ  ಕ ಟಕ ಅ ಯಮ : 23 
 

ಕ ಟಕ  ೕ ಗ  ಪರ ನ  ೕ ವ ( ಪ ) ಅ ಯಮ, 2020 
(2020 ರ ಅ ೕಬ  ಂಗಳ  19  ಂಕ  ಕ ಟಕ ಜ ಪತ ದ ಷ ಯ   ದ  

ಪ ಕಟ ) 

 

ಕ ಟಕ  ೕ ಗ  ಪರ ನ  ೕ ವ ಅ ಯಮ, 1952  ಮತ  

ಪ  ಡ  ಒಂ  ಅ ಯಮ. 

ಇ  ಇ ಂ  ಬ ವ ಉ ೕಶಗ  ಕ ಟಕ  ೕ ಗ  

ಪರ ನ  ೕ ವ ಅ ಯಮ, 1952  (1952ರ ಕ ಟಕ ಅ ಯಮ VIII) ಮತ  

ಪ   ಕ ದ ಂದ; 

ಇ , ರತ ಗಣ ಜ ದ ಎಪ ಂದ  ವಷ ದ  ಕ ಟಕ ಜ  

ನ ಡಲ ಂದ ಈ ಂ  ಅ ಯ ತ ಗ , ಎಂದ :-   



4 

 
1. ಪ  ಸ  ಮ  ಭ.- (1) ಈ ಅ ಯಮವ  ಕ ಟಕ 

 ೕ ಗ  ಪರ ನ  ೕ ವ ( ಪ ) ಅ ಯಮ, 2020 ಎಂ  ಕ ಯತಕ . 

(2) ಇ  ಈ ಡ   ಬರತಕ . 

2. 4  ಪ ಕರಣದ ಪ .- ಕ ಟಕ  ೕ ಗ  ಪರ ನ  ೕ ವ 

ಅ ಯಮ, 1952ರ (1952ರ ಕ ಟಕ ಅ ಯಮ VIII) (ಇ  ಇ ಂ  ಲ 

ಅ ಯಮ ಂ  ಉ ೕ ಸ ) 4  ಪ ಕರಣದ  ``ಸ ರ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದ 

ಬ ಗಳ  ಆ ಪದದ ತ ಯ ``ಅಥ  ಸ ರ  ಅ ತ ದ ಅ ’’ 

ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ  ಅ ಗಳ ಪ ತ ಯಗ ಂ  ಸತಕ . 

3. 5  ಪ ಕರಣದ ಪ .- ಲ ಅ ಯಮದ 5  ಪ ಕರಣದ  ``ಐ  

 ಗ ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗ  ̀ `ಐವ  ರ ಗ ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ  

ಪ ೕ ಸತಕ .  
 

4. 6  ಪ ಕರಣದ ಪ .- ಲ ಅ ಯಮದ 6  ಪ ಕರಣದ  ``ಒಂ  
ರ ಗ ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗ  ``ಒಂ  ಲ  ಗ ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ  

ಪ ೕ ಸತಕ . 
 

5. 7  ಪ ಕರಣದ ಪ .- ಲ ಅ ಯಮದ 7  ಪ ಕರಣದ ,- 

(i) (1)  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ,- 

(ಎ) ``ಸ ರ ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದದ ತ ಯ ``ಅಥ  ಸ ರ  ಅ ವ 

ಅ ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ  ಸತಕ ; ಮ  

( ) ``ಒಂ  ರ ಗ ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗ  ``ಒಂ  ಲ  ಗ ’’ 

ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ  ಪ ೕ ಸತಕ . 

(ii) (2)  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ,- 

(ಎ) ``ಸ ರ ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದದ ತ ಯ ``ಅಥ  ಸ ರ  ಅ ವ 

ಅ ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ  ಸತಕ ; ಮ  

( ) ``ಒಂ  ರ ಗ ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗ  ``ಒಂ  ಲ  ಗ ’’ 

ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ  ಪ ೕ ಸತಕ . 

6. 8  ಪ ಕರಣದ ಪ .- ಲ ಅ ಯಮದ 8  ಪ ಕರಣದ  ``ಸ ರದ’’ 

ಎಂಬ ಪದದ ತ ಯ ``ಅಥ  ಸ ರ  ಅ ವ ಅ ಯ’’ ಎಂಬ 

ಪದಗಳ  ಸತಕ . 



 5 

 
7. 9  ಪ ಕರಣದ ಪ .- ಲ ಅ ಯಮದ 9  ಪ ಕರಣದ (1)  

ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ  ``ಸ ರದ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದದ ತ ಯ ``ಅಥ  ಸ ರ  

ಅ ವ ಅ ಯ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ  ಸತಕ . 
 

 The above translation of Karnataka Race Courses Licensing (Amendment) 

Act, 2020.(Karnataka Act 23 of 2020) shall be authoritative text in the Kannada 

language under section 5-A of the Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963 

(Karnataka Act 26 of 1963).  

 

ವ  ಲ 
ಕ ಟಕ ಜ ಲ  

 
ಕ ಟಕ ಜ ಲರ  ಆ ಶ ರ 

ಮ  ಅವರ ಸ ನ , 

( . ರಕ  ) 
ಸ ರದ ಯ ದ  

ಸ ೕಯ ವ ವ ರಗ  ಮ  
ಸನ ರಚ  ಇ . 

 
        
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

ಮುದಕರು ಾಗೂ ಪ ಾಶಕರು:- ಸಂಕಲ ಾ ಾ ಗಳ , ಕ ಾ ಟಕ ಾಜ ಪತ , ಸ ಾ  ೇಂದ  ಮುದ ಾಲಯ, ೆಂಗಳ ರು 

R.N.I.  No. KARBIL/2001/47147  POSTAL REGN. No. RNP/KA/BGS/2202/2017-19 

Licensed to post without prepayment   WPP No. 297 


		2020-10-20T17:21:01+0530
	SUNIL GARDE




